

EXHIBIT "B"

E-225

John F. Cullen, Esquire
Law Offices of John F. Cullen, P.C.
17 Accord Park Drive, Ste. 103
Norwell, MA 02061

Invoice submitted to:
Cumberland Farms Investment Corp.

October 26, 2007

Invoice # 10438

Professional Services

		Hrs/Rate	Amount
10/24/1990	BALANCE CARRIED FORWARD FROM INTERIM APPLICATION OF JOHN F. CULLEN, FORMER CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE (SEE EXHIBIT A)	244.90 189.83/hr	46,489.37
10/25/1990	Review Court decision on Motion to Examine Boyajian; Conference with Bertozzi, Furness and Weingarten.	0.83 210.00/hr	175.00
10/26/1990	Conference, Meetings with Furness and Bertozzi re: filing motion; Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: bond financing.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
10/29/1990	Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: letters to Furness on financing consent; Review Chorney statement of issues on appeal.	0.83 210.00/hr	175.00
11/1/1990	Preparation with Bertozzi re: Motion for 2004 Examination.	1.83 210.00/hr	385.00
	Review letters from redemption coin claimants; Conference with Bertozzi, Weingarten and Furness re: financing; Follow-up with Bertozzi re: coin holder claimants.	1.17 210.00/hr	245.00
	Review of letter for redemption coin claimant and letter to attorneys; Review Smith Deposition Notice; Review Orders on sale.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
11/2/1990	Conference with redemption coin holder claimants and attorneys; Conference with and letters to Weingarten, Furness and Bertozzi; Review Chorney objection to financing, and prepare for hearing.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
11/5/1990	Telephone conference with Bertozzi re: obtaining Court Order.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50

E-226

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
11/5/1990	Conference with Bertozzi, Furness and Weingarten re: financing order.	0.83 210.00/hr	175.00
11/6/1990	Conference with Bertozzi, Weingarten and Furness re: Trustee's duties regarding financing and attention to expense list.	0.83 210.00/hr	175.00
11/7/1990	Conference with Bertozzi, Furness & Bankruptcy Court Clerk re: administration of duties; Review of Affidavits and Rule 2004 Order.	1.25 210.00/hr	262.50
11/8/1990	Review claimants' letters and response; Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten; Review Pre-Trial Stipulation on Eastland claim.	0.83 210.00/hr	175.00
11/9/1990	Conference with Bertozzi, Furness and Weingarten.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
11/14/1990	Conference with Bertozzi, Furness and Weingarten re: pending motions; Review Request for Hearing and letter to Bankruptcy Court.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
11/15/1990	Conference with Bertozzi re: conversation with Weick concerning coin sale.	0.42 210.00/hr	87.50
11/16/1990	Conference with Bertozzi re: Boyajian, redemption of coins and bond.	0.83 210.00/hr	175.00
11/19/1990	Telephone conference with Bertozzi re: Rule 2004 examination.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
	Telephone conference with Bertozzi re: conversation with Hershel Smith.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
11/20/1990	Conference with Weingarten and Bertozzi re: Motion to Sell.	0.83 210.00/hr	175.00
11/21/1990	Conference with Bertozzi re: status update and drafting of Request for Hearing.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
11/23/1990	Review letters from Furness on coins and real estate.	0.15 210.00/hr	31.50
11/27/1990	Review Notices; Work with Bertozzi in preparation for Pre-Trial Order; Prepare for hearing.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
11/28/1990	Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: drafting of pre-trial order; Preparation for pre-trial; Conference with Bertozzi re: negotiations with Attorney Oster on Pre-Trial Order.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
11/29/1990	Preparation for hearing; Conference with Bertozzi, Weick and McGowan; Attend hearing on financing, negotiations and possible agreement with Weick.	3.00 210.00/hr	630.00
11/30/1990	Review Eastland brief with Bertozzi; Conference with Hollis; Preparation of financing order.	1.67 210.00/hr	350.00

E-227

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/3/1990	Conference with Bertozzi, Oster, Smith, Chorney and Weick; Attend meeting on negotiations with DeLuca and Oster.	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00
	Conference with Bertozzi re: his conversation with DeLuca, Oster, and Smith regarding revision of order.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/4/1990	Conference with Bertozzi, DeLuca and McGowan re: Order; Conference with Bertozzi re: sales.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/5/1990	Review order with Bertozzi.	0.67 210.00/hr	140.00
12/6/1990	Reviewing Furness letters; conference with Bertozzi re: landlord claim and discussions with attorneys.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50
12/7/1990	Conference with Bertozzi re: antique coins and auction.	0.67 210.00/hr	140.00
12/11/1990	Conference with Bertozzi and attorneys re: Court Order and sale of coins.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/12/1990	Conference with Bertozzi re: status update; Draft letter to J. Votolato on financing order.	0.83 210.00/hr	175.00
12/13/1990	Review redemption notice; Review letters from Oster and Weingarten on list of redemption coin claimants; Obtain financing order entry.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/14/1990	Review Chorney program on sale of coins; Review letters to attorneys; Review payroll records; Conference with Bertozzi.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/16/1990	Meeting with Bertozzi and Furness re: sales; Conference with attorneys re: People's coins.	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00
12/18/1990	Conference with Bertozzi re: redemption of coins.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
12/19/1990	Conference with Bertozzi, Weingarten and attorneys re: sale of coins and financing agreement.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/20/1990	Conferences with attorneys re: People's Bank on sales.	3.50 210.00/hr	735.00
12/21/1990	Review and work on Response to letters from redemption claimants with Bertozzi; Conference with attorneys.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/24/1990	Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: Motions to Sell and application by Weingarten.	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00
12/26/1990	Telephone conference with Bertozzi and Furness re: Manter deposition.	1.25 210.00/hr	262.50

E-228

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/26/1990	Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: Motions to Reduce Time and revise Motions to Sell and accompanying letters.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
12/27/1990	Conference with Bertozzi re: coin sales and grading.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
12/28/1990	Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: coin grading and sales.	0.80 210.00/hr	168.00
12/31/1990	Review of Smith letter; Work on draft response with Bertozzi.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
1/2/1991	Review Notices of Deposition; Conference with Bertozzi re: hearing of sale.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
1/3/1991	Review Chorney objections; Conference with Bertozzi and attorneys re: redemption coin claimants.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50
1/4/1991	Review objections; Conference with Bertozzi.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
1/5/1991	Research legal issues with Bertozzi; Prepare for hearing on Motions to Sell.	3.00 210.00/hr	630.00
1/6/1991	Research legal issues on Trustee sale with Bertozzi and prepare for hearing.	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00
1/7/1991	Prepare for hearing on Trustee's Motion to Sell; and Conference with attorneys.	3.00 210.00/hr	630.00
1/9/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: letter to Posner.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
1/12/1991	Review People's bank documents and research legal issues with Bertozzi.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
1/14/1991	Conference with Bertozzi and Furness on Eastland claim.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
1/15/1991	Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: sales, redemption of coins; Conference with Bertozzi on possible settlement with Eastland.	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00
1/16/1991	Review pleadings on contempt hearing, McGowan motion and research issues.	1.25 210.00/hr	262.50
1/17/1991	Meeting at Bankruptcy Court with Furness and Smith; Conference with McGowan on redemption coin settlement; Review pre-trial stipulations.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
1/18/1991	Review People's proof of claim; Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten on grading and financing order.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50

E-229

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/24/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: People's coin sale and supplementary order.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
1/28/1991 Review redemption claimant list and filings by Chorney.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
1/30/1991 Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: sales.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
2/6/1991 Meeting with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: sales, auctions and marketing.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
2/7/1991 Meeting with Bertozzi re: investigation; Meeting with Judge Votolato and Bertozzi re: Trustee bond.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
2/14/1991 Conference with Bertozzi and Smith re: Christie auction; Review agreement on People's sale.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
2/15/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: his conversation with Attorney Carr on redemption of coins.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
2/18/1991 Review Chorney's objection to payment; Review creditor's committee Motion for Redemption.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
2/19/1991 Conference with Bertozzi on People's sale.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
2/25/1991 Conference with Bertozzi on People's sale and redemption coin issues.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
2/26/1991 Review Court Orders and applications; Conference with Bertozzi on coin sales.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50
2/27/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: People's sale re: possible settlement with McGowan.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
2/28/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: settlement.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50
3/1/1991 Conference with Bertozzi and Furness re: settlement and sales.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
3/4/1991 Conference with Bertozzi on coin liquidation.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
3/5/1991 Review Weingarten report and sales plan; Prepare for meeting with Bertozzi.	3.00 210.00/hr	630.00
Meeting with Bertozzi on Christie sale.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00

E-230

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
3/6/1991 Review Christie's agreement; Meeting with Bertozzi on Chorney claims.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
3/7/1991 Meeting with Bertozzi and Weingarten on sales and turnover.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
3/8/1991 Review motion and prepare exhibits; Auctioneer agreement; Conference with Bertozzi	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00
Review contract and discuss modifications and possible revisions with Bertozzi.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
3/11/1991 Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: auction contracts.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
3/13/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: auction.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
3/14/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: court action on motions.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
3/18/1991 Review Miller claim on coin sale; Conference with attorneys.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
3/19/1991 Conference with Bertozzi on sales and report.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
3/22/1991 Review memos for Judge Pettine.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
3/29/1991 Telephone conference with Bertozzi re: Christie auction.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
Conference with Bertozzi re: objections.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50
3/30/1991 Review and prepare for Smith deposition; Review appellate proceedings.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
4/1/1991 Review objections to sales; Conference with Bertozzi.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
4/2/1991 Review documents on stamps and coins.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
4/8/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: sales and records.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
4/9/1991 Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: objections to sales.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/10/1991	Conference with Furness and Bertozzi re: collection issues and appeals.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
4/11/1991	Review Wieck motion.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
4/12/1991	Review Eastland's appellate brief; Draft joinder with Bertozzi.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
4/16/1991	Review of brief and Chorney appeal.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
4/19/1991	Review examiner's report; Draft motion under seal with Bertozzi.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
4/22/1991	Review Eastland's appeals brief; Conference with Bertozzi; Work on draft of Trustee's Motion to Join.	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00
	Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: depositions and appellate pleadings.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
4/23/1991	Review appellate brief and conference with Bertozzi.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
5/8/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: People's coin sale.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50
5/9/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: possible negotiations; Attend hearing.	3.00 210.00/hr	630.00
5/10/1991	Conference with Bertozzi and Weingarten re: offer of sale.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
	Telephone conference with Bertozzi re: People's draft motion for auction.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
5/13/1991	Review Notice of Hearing on Motion to Sell.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
5/17/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: agreement on People's coin sale.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
5/20/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: Chorney settlement offer.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
5/22/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: People's coin sale and court order; Hearing at Bankruptcy Court on coin sale; Chorney's contempt motions.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
5/24/1991	Review redemption coin inventory with Bertozzi.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
6/3/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: Silverstein settlement.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
Conference with Bertozzi re: redemption coin claimants.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
6/6/1991 Meeting with Bertozzi and attorneys re: sales.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
6/12/1991 Conference with Bertozzi on draft motion to pay and borrow.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
6/14/1991 Conference with Bertozzi on court orders and credit union.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
6/17/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: sales procedure.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
7/10/1991 Attend hearing on Shine fee application; Review Order on Chorney and notice of appeal.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
7/11/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: safe deposit boxes and review of pending motions.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
7/16/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: Manter sale.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
7/17/1991 Meeting with Bertozzi re: redemption coin issues and possible McGowan settlement.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
7/18/1991 Meeting with Bertozzi and attorneys re: sales; Attend hearing on objections.	3.50 210.00/hr	735.00
7/19/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: coins, safe deposit boxes; and Review case materials.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
7/22/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: negotiation on bulk sale and bid condition letter.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
7/23/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: Aubin hearing.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
7/24/1991 Conference with Bertozzi re: Eastland issues.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
7/30/1991 Meeting with Bertozzi re: liquidation of assets and settlement of coin claims.	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00
8/1/1991 Meeting with Bertozzi and Smith re: Manter deal; Review Eastland proposal; Prepare objection to Chorney's recusal motion with Bertozzi.	2.50 210.00/hr	525.00

E-233

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/2/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: recusal brief.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
8/5/1991	Research recusal issues with Bertozzi; Prepare for Chorney hearing.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
8/6/1991	Conference with Bertozzi and Silverstein on safe deposit box; Prepare for recusal hearing with Bertozzi.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
8/7/1991	Review draft of Rule 2004 Motion.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
8/9/1991	Review Notice of Sale and Motion to Reduce Notice.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
8/14/1991	Review bank proposal with Bertozzi.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
8/15/1991	Conference with Bertozzi and McGowan re: redemption of coins and liquidation; Eastland proposal; Conference on bond.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
8/16/1991	Review and final revisions to Motion to Limit Notice of the Trustee's Intended Sale and file same.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
8/20/1991	Review and final edits to Motion for Examination of Safe Deposit Box No. 945 at Eastland Bank under Rule 2004 and file same.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
8/22/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: redemption coin claimant.	0.25 210.00/hr	52.50
8/26/1991	Conference with Bertozzi re: Manter offer; Conference on Chorney appeal and safe deposit boxes.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
8/29/1991	Review report to court and bank proposal.	1.25 210.00/hr	262.50
9/3/1991	Review Endorsement Order granting Motion to Limit Notice of the Trustee Notice of Intended Sale.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
9/5/1991	Review and final revisions to letter from Bertozzi re: Ms. Bramsch and file same with Court.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
9/10/1991	Final review and revisions to Notice for Intended Sale of VTI Personal Computer to Robert Carey with Bertozzi.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
9/12/1991	Review of Endorsement Order Grating Motion for Examination of Safe Deposit Box No. 945 at Eastland Bank Under Rule 2004.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
9/17/1991	Attend hearing re: Motion for Order to Show Cause Hearing.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
9/27/1991	Review and final revisions to Affidavit of Trustee re: Motion for Order to Show Cause Hearing and file same.	0.50 325.00/hr	162.50
10/1/1991	Review of Endorsement Order Granting Notice for Intended Sale of VT1 Personal Computer for Robert Carey.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
10/2/1991	Review of Bertozzi's Affidavit for Examiner Weingarten and Trustee Cullen re: Motion for Order to Show Cause.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
	Final draft and revisions to Brief/Memorandum in Support of Motion for Order to Show Cause Hearing and file same.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
11/1/1991	Review of Motion by Chorney to Compel Trustee to forward to Chorney, the personal mail of Chorney.	0.40 210.00/hr	84.00
11/4/1991	Review motion by Chorney to Compel Trustee to Allow Examination of Coins at Eastland Bank.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
11/13/1991	Final draft and revisions to Response/Objection to Motion to Compel Trustee to Forward to Chorney the personal mail of Chorney and file same.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
11/25/1991	Attend hearing re: Motion to Compel Trustee to Forward to Chorney, the personal mail of Chorney.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
11/27/1991	Review of Endorsement Order Granting Motion to Compel Trustee to Allow Examination of Coins at Eastland Bank.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
12/2/1991	Review of witness subpoena for John F. Cullen for December 12, 1991.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
	Review of Subpoena issued to Monica G. Shea for December 12, 1991.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
12/4/1991	Draft Motion to Quash Subpoena issued to Monica G. Shea and Objection to Chorney's Request for Production of Documents.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/5/1991	Final review and revisions to Motion to Quash Subpoena Issued to Monica G. Shea and Objection to Chorney's Request for Production of Documents and file same.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
12/7/1991	Draft Motion to Compromise Controversy with Eastland Bank, To Limit Notice with Bertozzi and final review of same.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/16/1991	Attend hearing re: Motion to Compel Trustee to forward to Chorney, the personal mail of Chorney.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00
12/17/1991	Attend hearing re: Motion to Quash Subpoenas Issued to Monica Shea and John Cullen.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
12/20/1991	Review Order Denying Motion to Limit Notice and Motion to Compromise Controversy with Eastland Bank.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
12/26/1991	Review of Witness Subpoenas Issued to John F. Cullen and Monica Shea for January 8, 1992.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
1/8/1992	Attend hearing re: Motion to Compel Trustee to Forward Personal Mail to Chorney and Objections.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
1/13/1992	Review Court Order re: Motion to Quash Subpoenas issued to John Cullen and Monica Shea.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
2/10/1992	Prepare Motion for Rule 2004 Examination of Chorney with Bertozzi.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50
2/27/1992	Review Court Order Granting Rule 2004 Examination of Chorney.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
3/4/1992	Review Court Order re: Motion to Compel Trustee.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
3/5/1992	Review Court Order re: Denying Motion to Vacate Previous Court Order Prohibiting Chorney from Engaging in Client Contact.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
6/8/1992	Attend Status Conference re: Motion for Order to Show Cause.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
6/10/1992	Review final Order by Judge Pettine re: Motion to Disqualify Judge, Motion to Adjudge Examiner in Contempt and Motion for Sanctions.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
6/11/1992	Review Complaint by Warren Taft against John F. Cullen for Recovery of Money and Property.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
6/18/1992	Attend Pre-Trial Hearing re: Order to Show Cause and Status Conference.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
7/6/1992	Review Order Granting Motion for Order to Show Cause against Chorney.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
7/8/1992	Preparation of Objection by Trustee to Aubin's Application for Administrative Expenses with Bertozzi.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
7/14/1992	Review Court Order Granting Petition for Instructions by Eastland Bank.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
7/16/1992	Attend hearing re: Motion to Stay Order pending appeal by Chorney.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
7/21/1992	Attend hearing re: Aubin's application for Admin. Expenses and Objections thereto.	0.75 210.00/hr	157.50
8/6/1992	Review Court Order re: Oster's Motion to Withdraw.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00

E-236

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
8/17/1992	Review Court Order Denying Chorney's Motion to Stay Pending Appeal.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
9/9/1992	Conference with Bertozzi re: prepare and review Trustee's Objection to Motion to Clarify Order Denying Chorney's Motion to Hold Examiner in Contempt.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
9/15/1992	Review Court Order Denying Chorney's Motion to Clarify Order.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
10/8/1992	Attend Status Conference re: Trustee's Potential Sale of Coins.	1.75 210.00/hr	367.50
10/13/1992	Review Conditional Order by Judge Torres re: Notice of Appeal and Motion to Show Cause and Motion to Stay Judgment.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
10/22/1992	Review Conditional Order re: Order Allowing Stay by Posting a Bond, Notice of Appeal by Chorney, Judgment Order.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
10/26/1992	Review Court Order Granting Motion to Release Coins Used as Evidence and for Turnover.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
12/2/1992	Prepare and review Trustee's Objection to Chorney's Motion to Vacate Court Order.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
1/13/1993	Review final Order by Judge Torres re: Motion to Show Cause/Sanctions against Chorney and Dismissal of Appeal.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
2/18/1993	Review Court Order Denying Chorney's Motion to Vacate.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
4/5/1993	Review final Order by Judge Pettine re: Chorney's Motion to Reconsider Decision of District Court Affirming Order re: disqualification of Bankruptcy Judge.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
12/20/1993	Prepare and review Trustee Objection re: Chorney's Motion to Continue Hearing on Conversion to Chapter 7.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
12/21/1993	Attend hearing on United States Trustee's Motion to Convert.	2.00 210.00/hr	420.00
12/22/1993	Review Court Order Denying Motion to Continue Hearing by Chorney.	0.20 210.00/hr	42.00
	Review Court Order Granting Motion to Convert Case from Chapter 11 to Chapter 7.	0.30 210.00/hr	63.00
2/14/1994	Prepare and review with Bertozzi Trustee's Response to Chorney's Motion to Compel Post Conversion Report.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
3/1/1994	Prepare and review with Bertozzi Trustee's Final Report Post Conversion.	1.50 210.00/hr	315.00

E-237

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4/29/1994 Prepare and review with Bertozzi Trustee's Response to Motion for Accounting.	0.50 210.00/hr	105.00
5/24/1994 Attend hearing re: Motion for Accounting during Chapter 11.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
7/11/2007 Travel to Bankruptcy Court in Rhode Island re: research case files; Travel back to Boston.	7.50 210.00/hr	1,575.00
7/12/2007 Telephone conference with Attorney Edward Bertozzi and Trustee, Jason Monzack re: questions regarding Chapter 11 administrative expenses and closing the case.	1.00 210.00/hr	210.00
7/16/2007 Travel to Providence, Rhode Island and doing records research.	7.50 210.00/hr	1,575.41
For professional services rendered	442.69	<u>\$88,081.78</u>
Balance due		\$88,081.78

E-238